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Applications for certification or
recertification in the AOCS Referee
Chemist program must be returned to
AOCS Headquarters, 508 S. Sixth St.,
Champaign, IL 61820, by no later
than March 15, 1977, or the applicant
will be ineligible to be listed in the
1977-78 official list of Referee
Chemists.

Recertification notices have been
mailed to last year's participants. New
applicants should write to AOCS
Headquarters and request application
forms. Recertification application fee
is $10; new applicant fee is $30.

Referee Chemist deadline is
March 15
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L'p1d S JANUARY 1977

Hypolipidemic Activity of (.)-Hydroxycitrate

Cholesterol Turnover in the Rat

Linoleamides and Lipid Metabolism

Hypobetalipoproteinemic Agent

An Overview of the Biochemical Pharmacology of Probucol
Mechanism of Action of Halofenate

Gemcadiol: A New Antilipemic Drug

Diet and Cholesteremia

Maximum lipid-Atherosclerosis Test
The Aspririn Myocardial Infarction Study

Safety/Efficacy of Hypolipidemics

Lipoproteins and Metabolism

Phosphonate Metabolism in the Rat

Haemagglutination Inhibitors

Dideuterated Octadecanoates

Autoxidation of Methyl Linoleate

Radical Alkylation of a-Tocopherol
Pentane and Ethane in Rat Breath

Phytanic Acid in Bovine Lipids

Fat Metabolism in Soybean Cells

Temperature and Fungal Lipids

Long Chain Alcohols in Rat Brain

J. AM. OIL CHEMISTS' SOC.. February 1977 (VOL. 54)

Easlman
va.
Inslabilily
Vegetable oil? A few years ago

we introduced a new antioxidant,
Tenox® TBHQ (tertiary butyl­

hydroquinone).

In vegetable oi Is, particu larly the

more polyunsaturated oils, TBHQ

has proven to be an extremely

effective antioxidant.

If you use BHA or BHT in your oil,
you might be better off with TBHQ.

At least, it may be worthwhile to

find out.

If you haven't evaluated TBHQ, we
would like to help. Call 800-251-0351
(in Tennessee 800-352-0301) or
send us this coupon.

Belter ProclucI8 forBetter Food.

•••••••••••••••I Health and Nutrition Division •

• Eastman Chemical Products, Inc., Kingsport, Tenn. 37662. •

• Please send me more information on Tenox TBHQ. •

• Name •

• Title I
• Company •• •• Address •

• City State lip •
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